Bid Tabulation

ITB 20-23"OFFSET PRINTING AND COPY SERVICES
FLORENCIE PATTON, PRINCIPAL BUYER
UNDERWOODF@JCCAL.ORG

JUST RITE PRINTING PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
ATTACHMENT A
. ) Cost per 500, 1000, 2000, 3000, 5000, 10,000 Cost per 500, 1000, 2000, 3000, 5000, 10,000

BW Copies Impression

500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000
BW SS Letter $ 6500 |$ 8200 (% 10800 (% 14500 (% 20200 [$§ 335.00 [ 135.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 212.00 | $ 258.00 | $ 367.00 | $ 543.00
BW SS Legal $§ 7000([$ 8700 (% 12500(|$ 158.00 (% 23200 [$§ 357.00 |3 154.00 | $ 212.00 | $ 313.00 | $ 391.00 | $ 466.00 | $ 669.00
BW SS Ledger $ 8000 [$ 10100 [$ 14100($ 21400($ 29500 [$  421.00 [ 160.00 | $ 226.00 | $ 366.00 | $ 418.00 | $ 517.00 | $ 749.00
BW DS Letter $ 8500 $ 11200 ($ 13500(|$ 158.00 (% 22500 [$  420.00 [ 150.00 | $ 181.00 | $ 247.00 | $ 313.00 | $ 439.00 | $ 648.00
BW DS Legal $ 9500 $ 11700 $ 15000 [$ 17000 |$ 24500 [$  445.00 |3 172.00 | $ 243.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 479.00 | $ 551.00 | $ 764.00
BW DS Ledger $ 10500 [$ 12200 [$ 18500 % 280.00 |$ 385.00 [$  560.00 |'s 183.00 | $ 258.00 | $ 466.00 | $ 502.00 | $ 605.00 | $ 902.00
BW Copies Impression - Subtotals $ 500.00|% 621.00 % 844.00 |$ 1,125.00 | $ 1,584.00 |$ 2,538.00 | $ 954.00 | $ 1,282.00 | $ 2,044.00 | $ 2,361.00 |$ 2,945.00 | $ 4,275.00
BW Copies Impression - Totals $ 7,212.00] $ 13,861.00

. } Cost per 500, 1000, 2000, 3000, 5000, 10,000 Cost per 500, 1000, 2000, 3000, 5000, 10,000

Color Copies Impression

500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000
Color SS Letter $ 10100 ($ 16500 [$  230.00 [$ 26500 |$ 38500 |$  590.00 | s 179.00 | $ 312.00 | $ 358.00 | $ 458.00 | $ 659.00 | $ 784.00
Color SS Legal $ 17200 [$ 25800 [$  295.00 |[$ 34500 |$ 459.00 [$  614.00 |3 115.00 | $ 348.00 | $ 572.00 | $ 658.00 | $ 703.00 | $ 916.00
Color SS Ledger $ 19800 ($ 31800 ($  380.00 |$  411.00|$ 495.00 [$  630.00 |3 229.00 | $ 358.00 | $ 640.00 | $ 666.00 | $ 793.00 [$  1,075.00
Color DS Letter $ 14800 ($ 22800 ($  339.00 [$ 41200 |$ 53200 |$  670.00 | s 225.00 | $ 335.00 | $ 542.00 | $ 726.00 | $ 792.00 | $ 934.00
Color DS Legal $ 22500 $ 33000 ($ 38800 ($ 44300 |$ 590.00 |$  820.00 | s 321.00 | $ 542.00 | $ 889.00 | $ 946.00 | $ 997.00 [$  1,249.00
Color DS Ledger $ 26000 [$ 349.00 [$ 41500 |$ 52500 |$ 74800 | $ 1,091.00 | s 321.00 | $ 542.00 | $ 785.00 | $ 826.00 | $ 893.00 [$  1,279.00
Full Bleed Color Letter $ 16800 [$ 22800 ¢ 31500($ 335.00[$ 43500 |$  591.00|s 185.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 372.00 | $ 579.00 | $ 669.00 | $ 792.00
Full Bleed Color Ledger § 20500 [$ 331.00 [$ 399.00 [$ 44000 [$ 675.00 [$ 1,001.00 | 241.00 | $ 366.00 | $ 654.00 | $ 687.00 | $ 799.00 |[$  1,088.00
Color Copies Impression - Subtotals $ 147700 |$ 2,207.00 |$ 2,761.00 | $ 3,176.00 | $ 4319.00 [$ 6,097.00 | $ 1,816.00 | $ 3,127.00 |$  4,812.00 | $ 5546.00 [$ 6,305.00 | $ 8,117.00
Color Copies Impression -Totals $ 20,037.00] $ 29,723.00

Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000 Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000

Paper upgrades Cost per sheet

500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000
20lb Pastels - Letter size $ 66.00 | $ 83.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 222.00 | $ 351.00 0.0154 0.0035 0.0023 0.0023 0.0023 0.0023
20lb Pastels - Ledger size $ 71.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 133.00 | $ 166.00 | $ 248.00 | $ 371.00 0.0176 0.0092 0.0081 0.0069 0.0069 0.0069
241b Pastels - Letter size $ 67.00 | $ 84.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 361.00 0.0308 0.0161 0.0081 0.0058 0.0046 0.0046
241b Brights - Letter size $ 80.00 [$  129.00 |$ 153.00 | $ 187.00 | $ 258.00 | $ 432.00 0.0550 0.0403 0.0368 0.0311 0.0276 0.0276
65lb Brights - Letter $ 11100 [$  167.00 $ 240.00 | $ 299.00 | $ 422,00 | $ 741.00 0.0858 0.0851 0.0725 0.0713 0.0702 0.0690
671b Vellum - Letter $ 92.00 [$  133.00 | $ 183.00 | $ 218.00 | $ 283.00 | $ 511.00 0.0682 0.0437 0.0380 0.0334 0.0322 0.0299
90lb Bright - Letter $ 11100 [$  157.00 [ $ 198.00 | $ 228.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 585.00 0.1628 0.1495 0.1426 0.1334 0.1070 0.0943
1101b Pastel Index - Letter $ 11200 [$  149.00 |$ 198.00 | $ 231.00 | $ 318.00 | $ 602.00 0.0594 0.0518 0.0495 0.0483 0.0472 0.0403
100% Cotton - Ivory 24# $ 12500 [$  165.00 $ 199.00 | $ 239.00 | $ 322.00 | $ 604.00 0.2288 0.1783 0.1737 0.1668 0.1311 0.1277
100% Cotton - White 24# $ 12200 [$  161.00 [$ 191.00 | $ 231.00 | $ 314.00 | $ 589.00 0.2288 0.1783 0.1737 0.1668 0.1311 0.1277
25% Cotton Linen - White 24# $ 12100 [$  156.00 [ $ 198.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 301.00 | $ 555.00 0.4488 0.3922 0.2634 0.2243 0.2151 0.2105
25% Cotton Linen - Ivory 24# $ 12800 [$  165.00 [$ 208.00 | $ 242.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 585.00 0.4488 0.3922 0.2634 0.2243 0.2151 0.2105
Parchment 24# $ 12100 [$  161.00 [$ 199.00 | $ 248.00 | $ 322.00 | $ 561.00 0.3520 0.2852 0.2346 0.2024 0.1530 0.1449
Parchment 32# $ - |3 - |3 $ BE $ - 0.4004 0.3335 0.2691 0.2070 0.1990 0.1921
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Silver Certificate / Award $ 15300 [$  188.00 | $ 238.00 | $ 268.00 | $ 358.00 | $ 629.00 1.0120 0.9821 0.9787 0.8924 0.8752 0.8568
Gloss 80lb-Text - Letter $ 99.00 |$  118.00 | $ 151.00 | $ 177.00 | $ 228.00 | $ 385.00 0.0308 0.0265 0.0150 0.0115 0.0104 0.0046
Gloss 80Ib-Cover - Letter $ 11100 [$  138.00 | $ 179.00 | $ 209.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 497.00 0.0528 0.0483 0.0426 0.0391 0.0368 0.0265

Paper Upgrades Cost Per - Subtotals $  1,690.00 [$ 2,242.00 [$  2,890.00 |$  3,483.00 | $ 4,764.00 [$  8359.00 | $ 1,849.10 | $ 321580 [$ 554420 |$ 740130 [$ 11,324.00 [$ 21,762.00

Paper Upgrades Cost Per - Totals 3$ 23,428.00] $ 51,096.40
Just Rite Printing PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.

. . Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000 Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000

BW Copies Impression
500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000

Gloss 80Ib-Text - Ledger $ 84.00 |$  103.00 |$ 169.00 | $ 223.00 | $ 305.00 | $ 490.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 235.00 | $ 289.00 | $ 410.00 | $ 686.00
Gloss 80Ib-Cover - Ledger $ 11400 [$  218.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 489.00 | $ 785.00 |$  1,360.00 | $ 205.00 | $ 289.00 | $ 452.00 | $ 593.00 | $ 77200 [$  1,275.00
Gloss 100Ib Text- Letter $ 85.00 |$  104.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 405.00 | $ 685.00 | $ 148.00 | $ 198.00 | $ 257.00 | $ 309.00 | $ 425.00 | $ 640.00
Gloss 100lIb Cover - Letter $ 10500 [$  168.00 | $ 167.00 | $ 211.00 | $ 285.00 | $ 488.00 | $ 167.00 | $ 226.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 425.00 | $ 605.00 | $ 925.00
Gloss 1001b Text - Ledger $ 10800 ($  158.00 | $ 255.00 | $ 335.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 885.00 | $ 181.00 | $ 255.00 | $ 371.00 | $ 485.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 957.00
Gloss 1001b Cover - Ledger $  168.00 [$ 23000 |$ 355.00 | $ 505.00 | $ 755.00 |$  1,480.00 | $ 212.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 511.00 | $ 672.00 | $ 910.00 [$  1,520.00
Transparencies B&W - Clear $ - s - s - s K Nk - Is 871.00 | $ 1,646.00 [$ 304900 |$  4,692.00 |$  7,446.00 [$  14,769.00

BW Gloss and Transparencies SubTotals $ 66400 [$  981.00 [$ 1,476.00 |$  2,013.00 | $ 3,015.00 [$  5,388.00 | $ 1,934.00 | $ 312700 ($ 513500 |$ 746500 [$ 11,193.00 |[$ 20,772.00

BW Gloss and Transparencies - Total $ 13,537.00] $ 49,626.00

A A A RAND TOTA 8 64 4.00 8 44 .306.40

| Just Rite Printing | PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
ATTACHMENT B
] o . Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3000, 5000, 10,000 Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3000, 5000, 10,000
NCR SETS - Priced Per Set, incl. impression charge
500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000

B/W SS 2 Part NCR -Letter $  169.00 [$  222.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 636.00 [$  1,155.00 0.2838 0.2346 0.1898 0.1714 0.1610 0.1472
B/W SS 2 Part NCR - Legal $ 19000 [$  250.00 | $ 385.00 | $ 555.00 | $ 885.00 [$  1,410.00 0.3850 0.3036 0.3705 0.2680 0.2473 0.2312
B/W SS 3 Part NCR - Letter $ 19500 $  270.00 | $ 455.00 | $ 646.00 | $ 1,020.00 |$  2,010.00 0.4224 0.3726 0.3197 0.2290 0.2974 0.2898
B/W SS 3 Part NCR - Legal $ 20500 (% 31000 |$ 485.00 | $ 788.00 | $ 1,288.00 |$  2,488.00 0.5038 0.4508 0.5565 0.3991 0.3910 0.3795
B/W SS 4 Part NCR - Letter $ 22500 %  355.00 |$ 485.00 | $ 701.00 | $ 1,111.00 |$  2,220.00 0.5192 0.4635 0.4313 0.4209 0.4163 0.4014
B/W SS 4 Part NCR - Legal $ 26500 % 42500 (% 885.00 [$  1,111.00 [$ 2,020.00 |$  3,685.00 0.6688 0.6544 0.6164 0.5923 0.5739 0.5555
B/W DS 2 Part NCR - Letter $ 20500 [$  260.00 |$ 493.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 785.00 |$  1,402.00 0.4774 0.3692 0.3013 0.2668 0.2392 0.1840
B/W DS 2 Part NCR - Legal $ 21500 [$  297.00 | $ 505.00 | $ 725.00 | $ 1,130.00 |$  2,188.00 0.5940 0.4600 0.3680 0.3393 0.3186 0.2979
B/W DS 3 Part NCR - Letter $ 22500 % 32500 (% 525.00 | $ 785.00 | $ 1,195.00 |$  2,330.00 0.6776 0.5026 0.4232 0.3807 0.3634 0.3393
B/W DS 3 Part NCR - Legal $ 26200 (% 38500 (% 701.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 1,534.00 |$  3,070.00 0.7062 0.5647 0.5049 0.4750 0.4635 0.4359
B/W DS 4 Part NCR - Letter $ 24500 [$  335.00 (% 585.00 | $ 797.00 | $ 1,385.00 [$  2,605.00 0.7062 0.6061 0.5279 0.5141 0.4738 0.4474
B/W DS 4 Part NCR - Legal $ 34000 [$ 58500 (% 1,011.00 |$ 151500 |$ 2,531.00 |$  4,810.00 0.8976 0.7717 0.7096 0.6762 0.6475 0.6348
Color SS 2 Part NCR - Letter $ 25000 [$  285.00 (% 390.00 | $ 490.00 | $ 730.00 |$  1,360.00 0.5082 0.4209 0.3634 0.3508 0.2956 0.2864
Color SS 2 Part NCR - Legal $ 25500 %  310.00 | $ 455.00 | $ 638.00 | $ 988.00 |$  1,880.00 0.5984 0.5329 0.4646 0.3899 0.3841 0.3807
Color SS 3 Part NCR - Letter $ 26500 |$ 32000 (% 540.00 | $ 725.00 | $ 1,085.00 |$  2,110.00 0.6314 0.5463 0.4439 0.4336 0.3922 0.3807
Color SS 3 Part NCR - Legal $ 27500 [$  349.00 | $ 608.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 1,403.00 [$  2,698.00 0.7942 0.7015 0.6452 0.5612 0.4669 0.4129
Color SS 4 Part NCR - Letter $ 29000 [$  360.00 |$ 570.00 | $ 780.00 | $ 1,205.00 |$  2,388.00 0.7854 0.6371 0.6118 0.6015 0.5405 0.4968
Color SS 4 Part NCR - Legal $ 35000 [$ 52000 (% 977.00 |$  1,369.00 [ $ 2,288.00 [$  4,499.00 0.9416 0.8959 0.8280 0.7567 0.6912 0.6475
Color DS 2 Part NCR - Letter $ 26800 (% 309.00 |3 444.00 | $ 610.00 | $ 909.00 [$  1,672.00 0.7854 0.5819 0.5187 0.4439 0.4117 0.3450
Color DS 2 Part NCR - Legal $ 27800 (% 318.00 |3 605.00 | $ 802.00 | $ 1,282.00 |$  2,496.00 0.7920 0.6567 0.6026 0.4842 0.3979 0.3163
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Color DS 3 Part NCR - Letter $ 288.00 | $ 368.00 | $ 682.00 | $ 906.00 | $ 1,410.00 |$  2,732.00 0.8140 0.6394 0.5532 0.5129 0.4163 0.3749

Color DS 3 Part NCR - Legal $ 298.00 | $ 410.00 | $ 78200 |$ 1,131.00 | $ 1,810.00 | $  3,534.00 1.0384 0.9108 0.8142 0.6601 0.5785 0.5026

Color DS 4 Part NCR - Letter $ 348.00 | $ 377.00 | $ 73500 |$  1,020.00 | $ 1515.00 |$  3,115.00 0.9636 0.8085 0.7452 0.6946 0.6107 0.5210

Color DS 4 Part NCR - Legal $ 448.00 | $ 52800 |$ 1,00800 |$ 1,763.00 | 2,880.00 [$  4,888.00 1.3772 1.2558 1.1661 0.8384 0.7406 0.6728

NCR Sets - Subtotals $ 6,354.00 [$ 8,473.00|$ 14,731.00 |$ 20,522.00 | $ 33,025.00 | $ 62,745.00 | $ 8,435.90 | $ 1434150 [$ 26,152.00 | $ 34,381.80 [$ 52,595.50 | $  96,815.00
$

ATTACHMENT B - GRAND TOTAL

ATTACHMENT C

ENVELOPES AND LETTERHEAD incl. impression charge

145,850.00

Just Rite Printing

Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000, 15,000, 25,000 (additional 1,000 over 25,000)

Envelopes and

500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 15,000 25,000 Add’1 1,000 Letterhead
Subtotals
mggg\’ HITE WOVE IMPACT REGULAR ENVELOPES | ¢ 68.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 580.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 1,458.00 | $ 58.00 | ¢  3.732.00
mggg\’ HITE WOVE IMPACT WINDOW ENVELOPES | ¢ 70.00 [$  101.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 188.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 598.00 | $ 890.00 | $ 1,477.00 | $ 60.00 | ¢  3.824.00
w)ozigév: ITE WOVE IMPACT WINDOW ENVELOPES | 70.00 [$  101.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 188.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 598.00 | $ 890.00 | $ 1,477.00 | $ 60.00 ¢  3,824.00
w)ozigév: ITE WOVE IMPACT REGULAR ENVELOPES | ¢ 68.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 580.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 1,458.00 | $ 58.00 [¢  3,732.00
LETTERHEAD WITH WATERMARK 25% COTTON LINEN | $  110.00 |$  125.00 | $ 215.00 | $ 318.00 | $ 498.00 | $ 988.00 | $ 1,460.00 | $ 2,198.00 | $ 11500 | $  6,027.00
LETTERHEAD W/O WATERMARK 25% COTTON LINEN | $ 98.00 [$  105.00 | $ 179.00 | $ 268.00 | $ 448.00 | $ 888.00 | $ 1,328.00 | $ 2,101.00 | $ 11000 | $  5525.00
ATTACHMENT C (ENVELOPES AND LETTERHEAD) TOTAL $ 26,664.00

|[ATTACHMENT C PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.

Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000, 15,000, 25,000 (additional 1,000 over 25,000)

ENVELOPES AND LETTERHEAD incl. impression charge Envelopes and
500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 15,000 25,000 Add’11,000 | =
mg@ HITE WOVE IMPACT REGULARENVELOPES 1o 17600 | 205.00 | 8 249.00 | $ 293.00 | $ 378.00 | $ 594.00 | $ 808.00 | $ 1,238.00 | $ 4200 (¢ 3983.00
mg@ HITE WOVE IMPACT WINDOWENVELOPES 1o 17900 |5 212,00 |8 263.00 | $ 313.00 | $ 412.00 | $ 661.00 | $ 904.00 | $ 1,401.00 | $ 49.00 ¢ 4394.00
@?OZEZGWOH ITE WOVE IMPACT WINDOWENVELOPES - 1o 15500 |s 18400 | 233.00 | $ 283.00 | $ 382.00 |$ 631.00 | $ 877.00 | $ 1,378.00 | $ 49.00 ¢ 4169.00
w)ozigng ITE WOVE IMPACT REGULAR ENVELOPES 1o 14800 |s  178.00 | 219.00 | $ 263.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 566.00 | $ 778.00 | $ 1,215.00 | $ 4200 (¢ 3759.00
LETTERHEAD WITH WATERMARK 25% COTTON LINEN | $  368.00 |$  511.00 | $ 762.00 | $ 849.00 | $ 1,192.00 [$  2,193.00 | $ 3,631.00 | $ 5,563.00 | $ 292.00 | § 15,361.00
LETTERHEAD W/O WATERMARK 25% COTTON LINEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |g .
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. . Just Rite Printing PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
BUSINESS CARDS incl. impression charge

Cost per box of 250, 500, 1000 Cost per box of 250, 500, 1000
Business Business Cards
250 500 1,000 250 500 1,000 .
Cards Subtotal per line
Two color, one sided w/ Jefferson County logo, cost includes
shell plus name personalization $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 45.00 | ¢ 125.00 | $ 194.00 | $ 201.00 | $ 224.00 | ¢ 619.00
Two color, one sided w/ Sheriff’s logo, cost includes shell plus
name personalization $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 45.00 | ¢ 125.00 | $ 194.00 | $ 201.00 | $ 224.00 | ¢ 619.00
Two colors, two sides (back with full bleed, screen and reverse
type) for Jefferson County Health Systems
60.00 70.00 75.00 . 251.00 258.00 552.00 .
(Cooper Green Mercy Health Services), cost includes shell plus $ $ $ $ 205001 % $ 3 $ 1,061.00
name personalization
Two colors, one sided w/Jefferson County District Attorney’s
logo (Seal of Alabama), cost includes shell (plus name $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 45.00 $ 194.00 | $ 201.00 | $ 224.00
personalization) $ 125.00 $ 619.00
Two colors, two sided (line copy flat printed on back) with $  6000|$  70.00|$% 75.00 $ 223.00 [$ 23100 |$ 260.00
Sheriff’s logo, cost includes shell plus name personalization. $ 205.00 $ 714.00

Two colors, one sided with Hoover School Board logo, cost

includes shell plus name personalization. $ 380018 420019 45001s 125.00 | $ 1040019 201008 240013 619.00
Two colors, one sided with Jefferson County School Board logo,
cost includes shell plus name personalization. $ 38.00 | $ 4200 | 4500 g 125.00 | 194.00 | $ 201.00 | $ 22400 | g 619.00
One color,_whlte linen stock, one-sided Wlth_.]ef_ferson County $ 4200 | s 45.00 | s 50.00 $ 152.00 | $ 157.00 | $ 182.00
logo, cost includes shell plus name personalization $ 137.00 $ 491.00
A. Two colors, one-sided, gold & black on natural fiber stone
stock with D.A., Worthless Check, cost includes shell plus name| $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 [ $ 45.00 $ 183.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 210.00
personalization. $ 125.00 $ 583.00
Three colors, one-sided, Bessemer District Attorney, cost
includes shell plus name personalization. $ 60008 68009 80013 206.00 | $ 23400 | $ 240008 2650078 739.00
Three colo_rs, white linen stock, one-sided W_lth ._]efferson County $ 60.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 78.00 $ 234.00 | 8 240.00 | $ 265.00
logo, cost includes shell plus name personalization. $ 206.00 $ 739.00
Business Cards (Per Box Count) Subtotals s s51000]s s57300(s 62600 s 224700[s 232100[s 285400
Business Cards Per (Box Count/Per Line Item) Total $ 1,709.00| $ 7,422.00

ATTACHMENT C - GRAND TOTAL 28,373.00 $ 39,088.00
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Just Rite Pri

nting

PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.

ATTACHMENT D Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000 Cost per 500, 1000, 2,000, 3,000, 5000, 10,000
L . Finishing Finishing Services
Finishing services 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 Services 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000
Subtotals Subtotals
Lamination Letter - 5 Mil $ 31000|$ 60000 |$ 1,200.00 |$  1,600.00 |$ 2,60000 [$ 5720000 [$  11,510.00 [ 510.00 | $ 960.00 [$  1,860.00 [$ 2,760.00 [$  4,560.00 |$ 9,060.00 | $ 19,710.00
Lamination Legal - 5 Mil $ 32500 |$ 630.00|$ 1,280.00 |$  1,770.00 | $ 2,70000 [$ 540000 [$  12,105.00 |'$ 960.00 |$  1,860.00 |$  3,660.00 [$ 5460.00 [$  9,060.00 [$ 18,060.00 | $ 39,060.00
Lamination Ledger - 5 Mil $ 35000 |$ 700.00 |$ 1,360.00 |$  2,000.00 |$ 3,250.00 [$ 6,300.00 [$  13,960.00 ['$ 960.00 |$  1,860.00 |$  3,660.00 [$ 5460.00 [$  9,060.00 [$ 18,060.00 | $ 39,060.00
Hand Stapling NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |[$ - I3 55.00 | $ 123.00 | $ 247.00 | $ 370.00 | $ 616.00 [$ 1,232.00 | $ 2,643.00
Booklet Make w/trim $ 85.00 |$  110.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 290.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 1,335.00 | s 112.00 | $ 247.00 | $ 493.00 | $ 739.00 [$  1,23200 [$ 2464.00 | $ 5,287.00
Machine Stapling Upper Left $ 38.00 [ $ 44.00 | $ 68.00 [ $ 88.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 616.00 | 5 55.00 | $ 123.00 | $ 247.00 | $ 370.00 | $ 616.00 |$ 1,232.00 [ $ 2,643.00
Stapling Double Staple - Left $ 48.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 88.00 [ $ 110.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 268.00 | $ 727.00 § 3 118.00 | $ 247.00 | $ 493.00 | $ 739.00 [$  1,232.00 [$ 2.464.00 [ $ 5,293.00
Folding Per Sheet (Machine) $ 30.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 90.00 [ $ 110.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 748.00 0.1364 0.0748 0.0409 0.0292 0.0219 0.0190( $ 0.32
Folding by Hand (Per sheet) $ 55.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 255.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 1,100.00 0.2170 0.2170 0.2170 0.2170 0.2170 0.2170[ $ 611.90
Cutting Per Cut (Per 250 Sheets) $ 20.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 350.00 § 5 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 4,665.50
Padding $ 20.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 350.00 [ s 44.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 202.00 | $ 32800 |$  633.00
Drilling (per 1000 sheets) $ 20.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 270.00 § 5 50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 50.00 [ $ 300.00
Tab Sets - Bank of 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOoBID |$ - I3 180.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 780.00 [$  1,260.00 [$ 2,460.00 | $ 5,520.00
Tape Binding 1-100 pages NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOoBID |$ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ -
Tape Binding 101+ pages NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOoBID |$ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ -
Comb Binding 1-100 pages $ 44000 [$ 87000 |$ 1,770.00 |$  2,630.00 | $ 4,280.00 |$ 860000 |$  18,590.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ -
Comb Binding 101 + pages $ 52500 % 89500 |$ 1,795.00 |$  2,650.00 | $ 4,310.00 |$ 863000 %  18,805.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ -
Coil Binding 1-100 pages $ 44000 |$ 87000 |$ 1,770.00 |$  2,630.00 | $ 4,280.00 |$ 860000 |$  18,590.00 |3 446.00 | $ 955.00 [$  1,932.00 [$ 291000 [$  4,865.00 [$ 9,752.00 [ $ 20,860.00
Coil Binding 101 + pages $ 525000|$ 895.00|$ 1,795.00|$  2,650.00 | $ 431000 |$ 863000($% 1880500 s 550.00 [$  1,150.00 [$  3,100.00 |$ 465000 |$  7,750.00 [$ 15,500.00 | $ 32,700.00
Perfect Binding $ 27500 |$  410.00 |$ 690.00 | $ 910.00 | $ 1,655.00 [$  3,300.00 | $ 7,240.00 | s 468.00 | $ 909.00 [$  1,760.00 [$ 2,611.00 [$  4,313.00 [$ 8413.00 [$ 18,474.00
Clear Cover - each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ - 0.2838 0.2691 0.2634 0.2611 0.2461 0.2358( $ 1.56
Solid Back Cover - each $  180.00 [$  250.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 850.00 |$  1,410.00 | $ 3,790.00 0.3300 0.3289 0.3094 0.2933 0.2404 0.3085| $ 5,309.60
Linen Cover - each $  180.00 [$  250.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 850.00 |$  1,410.00 | $ 3,790.00 0.3542 0.3519 0.3301 0.3128 0.2599 0.2473| $ 6,279.60
Regency Cover -each $  180.00 |$  250.00 |$ 450.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 850.00 |$  1,410.00 | $ 3,790.00 0.6930 0.7176 0.6486 0.6222 0.5509 0.5336| $ 5,900.10
Hand Collation NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID [$ - I3 118.00 | $ 246.00 | $ 492.00 | $ 738.00 [$  1,230.00 [$ 2,460.00 | $ 12,318.40
Perforating $ 40.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 470.00 I s 69.00 [ $ 75.00 | $ 82.00 | $ 88.00 [ $ 102.00 | $ 202.00 | $ 618.00
Scoring $ 40.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 605.00 | $ 69.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 82.00 [ $ 88.00 | $ 102.00 [$  202.00 | $ 618.00
Finishing Services Total| $ 137,546.00 Finishing Services Total| $ 209,600.98
Just Rite Printing PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
WIDE FORMAT PRINTING - PER SQ. FOOT Wide Format -
500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 Sl 500 1,000 2,000 3,000 5,000 10,000 Wide Format Subtotals
Color on Bond per sg. ft. $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 33.00]$ 518 | $ 518 |$ 518 | $ 518 |$ 518 | $ 518 | $ 31.08
Color on Glossy per sq. ft. $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 $ 33.000$ 518 | $ 518 |$ 518 | $ 518 | $ 518 | $ 518 $ 36.24
Color on Vinyl per sq. ft. $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 $ 33.000$ 6.04 [ $ 6.04 % 6.04 | $ 6.04 | $ 6.04 | $ 6.04 $ 31.08
B/W on Bond per sq. ft. $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 500 | $ 30.000 $ 518 | $ 518 |$ 518 | $ 518 | $ 518 | $ 518 $ 34.50
B/W on Vellum per sq. ft. $ 3.00 |$ 3.00 |$ 3.00 | $ 3.00|$ 3.00 | $ 3.00($ 18.001 $ 575 |$ 5751% 575 |$ 575 1% 575 |$ 5751 $ 34.50
Laminate per sq. ft. (3 mil) $ 3.00 |$ 3.00 |$ 3.00 | $ 3.00|$ 3.00 | $ 3.00($ 18.001 $ 575 |$ 5751% 575 |$ 575 1% 575 |$ 5751 $ 58.68
Large Format Mount on Foam Core per sq. ft. $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550 |$ 550 | $ 550 | $ 33.000 % 9.78 | $ 978 | $ 9.78 | $ 978 | $ 978 | $ 9.78 | $ -
Wide Format Subtotals| $ 198.00 Wide Format Subtotals| $ 226.08
ATTA D - GRAND TO $ 137,744.00 ATTA D - GRAND TOTAL [ 209,827.06
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Just Rite Printing

PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.

ATTACHMENT E SIZES SIZES SIZES SIZES SIZES SIZES SIZES SIZES
24X48 30X60 36X72 48X96 48X24 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRESENTATION CHECKS $ 50.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 94.00 | $ - 18 - |3 -
Presentation Checks - Subtotals $ 50.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 94.00 | $ - 13 3 z
A A PR A .
RAND TOTA $ 80.00 $ 94.00
Just Rite Printing I PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
ATTACHMENT F SIZES SIZES
. Display,
Display, Throws, TR oE. £
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS 4 FOOT 6 FOOT 8 FOOT 36 ROUND and Banners - 4 FOOT 6 FOOT 8 FOOT 36 ROUND e
Subtotal R
ppioes Subtotals
$ 288.00 | $ 308.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 348.00 $ - 18 27400 | $ 305.00| $
Display Table Covers - Variety Of Sizes With Logo $ 1,284.00 $ 579.00
Throws - Variety of Sizes With Logo $ 28000 %  298.00|$ 336.00] nNoBID [$ 914.00] NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ -

Banners - Variety of Sizes With Logo

ATTACHMENT F - (PROMOTIONAL ITEMS) GRAND
TOTAL

Prepared by Ericka Andrew 03.03.23

30x60

36Xx72

48x96

88.00 | $

98.00 | $

140.00

$ 225.00

2,749.00

4X8

142.00 | $

189.00

ATTACHMENT F - (PROMOTIONAL ITEMS) GRAND
TOTAL
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ATTACHMENT G Just Rite Printing PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
SELF INKING STAMPS IMPRESSION SIZES IMPRESSION SIZES
. 7/8x2 3/8 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
Trodat 4913 Self-Inking Stamp 3 2800 |5 =0.00
. 1.5x3 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
Trodat 4926 Self-Inking Stamp 3 300 |5 62.00
1x 2.75 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
Trodat 4915 $ 27.00 |'$ 56.00
. 7/8x 2 3/8 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
Shiny S-844 $ 28.00 | $ 59.00
Trodat. M-1 15/8 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
' $ 46.00 | $ 129.00
5/8 x 2 7/16 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
Pre-Inked Notary Stamp - ltem# XL-145 3 500 5 91.00
16/8 NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
Desk/Notary Seal Embossers 3 55.00 1S 140,00
Refill Ink Pad Most Sizes NO IMPRESSION SIZES SUBMITTED
$ 7.00 |'$ 30.00

ATTACHMENT G - (SELF-INKING STAMPS) GRAND
TOTAL

GRAND TOTAL (ATTACHMENTS A THRU G)

267.00 $ 617.00
3 417,924.19

Required Documents Just Rite Printing PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC.
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES
Statement of Compliance YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES
Signature Page YES YES
Bid Form YES YES
PACA Sheet YES YES
Amendment 1 YES YES
Contact Information
Just Right Printing 903 Decatur Hwy, Fultondale, AL 35068 | Brittany Rawls | 205-841-2447 | brittany@justriteprinting.com
PRECISION GRAPHICS, INC. 4121 Lewisburg Rd, Birmingham, AL 35207 | David Rasberry | 1-800-749-3531 | davidr@precisiongraphics.net
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